RECEWED

Posting Year: Posting Date: Posting#  Doc#
wSER 2 8 2020 " Period: | Ref # ) Initials:

FINANCE DIREGTGR'S OFFICE CITY OF ALLENTOWN BUDGET TRANSFER REQUEST FORM

TO: Jessica Baraket, Interim Director :_FBOM: - Leonard Lightner/Jean Brossman S
'BUREAU: Department of Finance BUREAU: CED B -
- N - TRANSFER DETAIL - -
Date of Request: 09.15.2020 Fund: General Transfer Amount: $31,800.00
B - o FROM (DEBIT) - - -
ACCOUNT (All 15 digits) ' ORIGINAL CURRENT ACCOUNT ACCOUNT TOTAL AFTER
and ACCOUNTTITLE ~ TRANSFER AMOUNT (5) ~ APPROPRIATION ($) TOTAL ($) TRANSFER ($) !
000-09-0901-0004-46 _ ~ $31,800.00 ~122,513.59 $51,453.59 ~ 19,653.59
| -
. I o f—— — N - _ '
__ B - ) ~ TO(CREDIT) - - -
1000-09-0901-0001-34 [ $7,950.00 §1_0,000.00_ [ $6,662.02 - 14,612.02 |
000-09-0903-0001-34 L 7,950.00 | ~10,000.00 4,088.31 | 12,038.31
000-09-0901-0006-34 530000 2,396.40 1,920.10 7,220.10
/000-03-0807-0001-34 il - 2,650.00 2,500.00 1,460.87 - 4,110.87
000-03-0701-0001-34 _ 2,650.00 100.00 | 100.00 2,750.00 |
000-03-0702-0001-34 5,300.00 4,815.00 2,905.10 ~ 8,205.10

'Reason Transfer is Required:
For Project Ma Management Certification Training for staff in Parks, Public Works and CED. This is a four course certification program that will give employees the tools,
skills and knowledge to carry out the roles and responsibiliies of a Project Manager.

'Reason Funds are Available for Transfer:
Due to Covid 19, many of the Special Events within the City have been canceled.

TRANSFER AUTHORIZATIONS WITHIN & BETWEEN PROGRAMS
Amount not more than $5 000.00

Amount is greater than $5 000. 00

Department Head Date: q /
'l;ector of Finén =N ; -.; ._. ' S > y B ) Date Qf 5%?56 |
Cuty Controller (rf amount ® \?;ea_har than $5,000): - f _ % ('f . — 50: 90
Mayor or Managmg Director (if amount is greater than $5,000): . \ k,___k Date: Gi L3 o 1o
'Rﬁto City Council in accordance with the provisions of the Administratfl C&Eé; Section 130.04: Date:_ .

CITY COUNCIL
|Daryl Hendricks, President. | - [ 1 Approved [ ] Disapproved B Date'
Juio Guridy, Vice President: [ ] Approved [ ] Disapproved | Date:] R
.Ce-Ce Gerlach, Councilperson: | - - [ 1 Approved | ] Disapprogr ~ Date:] )
_Ca_Mda Affa, Cﬂmcilperson | - B [ } Approved d [ ] Dnsapproved R - Dat?- - -
Lmbua Siegel&quncilpeﬂ L B AApprovgj [ ] Disapproved : _ Da_t; a
'Ed Zucal, Councilperson ] B [ 1 Approved [} @mved ) E;j )

Cynthia Mota, Councilperson | [ 1 Approved [ ] Disapproved Date: |



Rrossman, Jean
-

From: Lightner, Leonard

Sent: Wednesday, September 23, 2020 10:19 PM
To: Brossman, Jean

Subject: FW: transfer for Project management training
FYl

From: Glazier, Jeff <lJeff.Glazier@allentownpa.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, September 23, 2020 2:59 PM

To: Baraket, Jessica <Jessica.Baraket@allentownpa.gov>

Cc: Lightner, Leonard <Leonard.Lightner@allentownpa.gov>
Subject: transfer for Project management training

Jb,

This transfer should be redrafted so that each department’s 34 account pays for their employees to take the certification
course. Having CED pay for other departments’ training is not proper budgeting or expenditure practice.

A transfer should be drafted to transfer CED’s unused Special Event contract services funds to Public Work’s, Park’s and
CED’s training and professional development accounts.

Additionally, the transfer amount can be reduced w Mr. McMahon's departure.

Finally, does tuition have to be paid in 2020 for all four courses? If not, then less should be transferred now and the
balance should be budgeted in the 2021 budget.

Jeff

JEFF GLAZIER
CITY CONTROLLER

' Controller's Office
Allentown 435 Hamilton Street
City withowt Lmiyy. Allentown, PA 18101
P: +1(610) 437-7527 x2612

E: Jeff.Glazier@allentownpa.gov
W: www.allentownpa.gov

This message contains confidential information and is intended cnly for the intended
recipients. If you are not an intended recipient you should not disseminate, distribute or
copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this
e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. E-mail transmission cannot be
guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost,
destroyed, arrive fate or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore does not
accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as a
result of e-mail transmission. If verification is required please request a hard-copy version.




