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TRANSFER DETAIL

TO:

BUREAU

Brent A. Hartzell, Director

Department of Finance

" Period

Postinq Year: Posting Date:

Ref#

Posting #

Public Works - EngineeringBUREAU

FROM C Maqliane

CITY OF ALLENTOWN BUDGET TRANSFER REQUEST FORM

lnitials:

Doc #

Date of Request: 8-Feb-19 Fund Transfer Amount: 14,000.00

FROM

000-03-0707-0001 -20

ACCOUNT (All l5 dlgits)
and ACCOUNT TITLE

Electric Power

14,000.00

TRANSFER AMOUNT ($)

210,000.00

ORIGINAL
APPROPRTATTON ($)

208,O90.72

CURRENT ACCOUNT
TOrAL ($)

194,O90.72

ACCOUNT TOTAL AFTER
TRANSFER ($)

TO

ü
Rentals

000-0&0702-0001-30 14,000.00 2,500.00

tr¡(ElJl I

134.68 L4,t34.68

Reason Funds are Available for Transfer:

OCE Plotter lease payments: funds needed for 2019 lease payment; figure mistakenly noted as "PA One Activ¡ty Fee" @ $19,000 and removed in Budget Memo #5. lt
was asked that Finance keep the funds in the Engineering (46) account, but we were told to transferfrom another PW account with the start ofthe budget.

Reason Transfer is uired

At finances suggestion, we are transfening from the Building Maintenance electrical account as there is an anticipated overage based on our 201 8 usage.

TRANSFER AUTHORIZATIONS WITHIN & BETWEEN PROGRAMS

Refened to City Council in accordance with the prof\iøtís of the Adyinid{weõãilb, Section 130.04:

City Controller (¡f amount is greater than $5,000):

Mayor or Manas ins ú,r{"to, $ l^á"f,íis"s r¿ter than g5Ð)I T ^}'

Director of Finan 
"", 

-. y'.n#," ¡ î /ry*furffi a L.{./
LA, 4/ )'4 ?v-.\.--lDepartment Head

oate: V/l tql/ Xtq
D.*, .2'i/lV/'2f)(q
Date

X is greater than $5,000.00

Amount not more than $5,000.00

Date:

oate: /'-/\ - ['\

CITY COUNCIL

Daryl Hendricks, Councilpersoì$
Julio Guridy, Vice Presidenf: /,'z-/--
Roger MacLean, President:

Cynthia Mota, Councilperson

Courtnev Robinson, Councilperson

Candida Affa, Councilperson ,/t'i.H¿ Zr/l ¡.ffiproved [ ] D¡sapproved

I I Disapproved

[ ] Disapproved

1;h1 4/ffi Î{Approved I I Disapproved
[ ] Approved [ ] Disapproved

6,",*o-¿,f,.,f,Lr, t -l-Aó-proved I I Disapproved Date:

Date:

Date:

Date:

Date:

Date

Date

þLÉ,
9-l.z-

)/l;7x-',tÇ

4-tÇ
I ,1

EdZucal,





To:
Cc:

Sent:

Subject:

Magliane, Casandra

From: Patel, Bina

Friday, February 8, 2019 12:48 PM

Magliane, Casandra

Messinger, Craig; Cocca, Lisa; Danek, Audrey
RE: Building Maintenance (50) transfer

Cassie,

We will need a new budget transfer form completed.

Thank you.
Bina

From: Magliane, Casandra

Sent: Friday, February 8,2019 12:36 PM

To: Danek, Audrey <Audrey.Danek@allentownpa.gov>; Patel, Bina <Bina.Patel@allentownpa.gov>
Cc: Messinger, Craig <Craig.Messinger@allentownpa.gov>; Cocca, Lisa <Lisa.Cocca@allentownpa.gov>

Subject: RE: Building Maintenance (50) transfer

Audrey

The controller would like the OCE lease funds placed in a (30) account instead of the (46) account.
As the transfer has not been completed, can the account change be done using the attached email thread?

Regards,

Casandra Magliane

6 u-o¿/, g o1,<.rt¿,q a, B nÁg e'

From: Danek, Audrey
Sent: Wednesday, January 9,2079 11:10 AM
To: Magliane, Casandra <Casandra.Magliane@allentownpa.gov>; Patel, Bina <Bina.Patel@allentownpa.gov>
Subject: RE: Building Maintenance (50) transfer

Okay, thanks. I have your other one for the "OCE Plotter Lease" up with the mayor for him to sign.

From: Magliane, Casandra
Sent: Wednesday, January 9,2019 10:48 AM
To: Danek, Audrey <Audrev.Danek@allentownpa.gov>; Patel, Bina <Bina.Patel@allentownpa.gov>
Subject: Building Maintenance (50) transfer

Audrey

please see the attached transferform to fund a (50)account in Building Maintenance; the original is in the inter-office
mail.
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#Posting Year:

" Period:

Posting Date:

fRoM¡
BUREAU:

TRANSFER DETAIL

Fund: GENERAL

Posting #

Ref#

)c \r\
Doc

BUREAU

Date of Request:

Breñt A, Hartzell, Director

Department of Finance
.\\

TJan-19'

C Magliane

Public Works - Engineering

Transfer Amount:

CURRENTACCOUNT
rorAt,(!l

210,000.00

lnitials:

14,000.00

ACCOII.¡T TOTAL AFTER
TRANSFIR(¡)

196,000.00

I

CITY OF ALLENTOWN BUDGET TRANSFER REQUEST FORM

TO:

ACCoUNT(Alr5dþtt )
and ACGOUNT TITLE

000-03-0707-0001-20

Electric Power

000-03-0702-0001 -46

Other Contract Services

TRANStER AilOUNT (t)

' 14,000.00

\

FROM (DEBTT)
ORIGINAL

eppRr¡pRrAiloN (¡)

210,000.00

TO (CREgIr)

14,000.00 81,000.00 9s,000.00

Reason Transfer is Required:
OCE Plotter Lease Payments: Funds needed for 2019 lease payments; figure was mlstakenly noled as 'PA One Fee" @ $19,000 and removed in Budget Memo

#5. lt u/as asked lhat finance keep the funds in the Engin€€rlng (tl6) aocount, but we were told to t¡amfer f¡om another âccount insleâd.

Reason Funds are Available for Transfer:
At Flnancs's suggestion, we are transferr¡ng from the Building Maintenance eleolric account as there is an anlicipated on 2018 usage.

X

Dêpartm6nt Head:

Director of Finance:

9fly! tt¡l94Srq, councirpeßon:

Julio Guridy, Councllperson

Courtney Robinson, Counoilperson

Ed Zucal, Gounoilperson

Cynllda Mota, Councilp€rson

TRANSFER AUTHORIZATIONS WITHIN & BETWEEN PROGRAMS
Amount not more than $5,000.00

Amount is greater than $5,0p.00
/ ¡/ <

(-'u.t 5J 4''/r t*1{-" /'1 ,').//i' L/

Date: I
Date:

o"Lt

Dale:

1

Ma!ðr or Managing Director (if amount is greater than $5,000):

R€fened to City Counc¡l in accordance with the prov¡sions of the Adm¡nietrat¡ve Code, Sect¡on 130.04:

clwcouNcrl
Roger MacLean, President: [ ] Approved [ ] Disspproved

Candida Affa, Vioe President: [ ]Approved I lBisapproved

Date:

Date:.

Date:

Date:,

Dâte:

Date:

Dete:

I I 4pprovgd

I I Approved

[ ] Appmved

[ ] Approved

[ ] Approved I I Disapproved

I I Dlsepproved

I I Disapproved

[ ] Dlsapproved

[ ] Dlsepproved



From:
Sent
To:
Gc:

Subfect:

Maqliane, Casandra

Follow Up Flag:
Fhg Status:

Magliang Casandra
Tuesda¡ December 4,20181:19 PM
Wagenhursg Barbara

Messinger, Craig; Hartzell, Brent
RE: 2019 Engineering Budget - (46) 8¿ (68) Accounts
RE: PW PPL

Follow up
Completed

Attachments:

Per Craigls email to Brent, the PW fìgures were taken as low as we ant¡cipated PPL for 2019
lf that is finance's suggestion; I will earmark the funds and transfer when budget is opened.

Regards,
Casandra Magliane

Bou:lzL go1,aøe(f * Brtfuo.,

From: Wagenhurst, Ba rbara <Ba rbara.Wagenhurst@allentownpa.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, December 4,2OL81:04 PM
To: Magliane, Casandra <Casandra.Magliane@allentownpa.gov>
Cc: Messinger, Craig <Craig.Messinger@allentownpa.gov>; Hartzell, Brent <Brent.Hartzell@allentownpa.gov>
Subject: RE: 2019 Engineering Budget - (46) & (68) Accounts

According to the report you prepared on the electricity accounts for 2019, it should Building Maintenance is anticipated
to be over budgeted by S3g,OOO which we left in the budget. I suggest transferring the S1g,00O from that account nelt
year.

From: Magliane, Casandra
Sent: Tuesday, December 4,2AL8 9:14 AM
To: Wagenhurst, Barbara <Barbara.Waeenhur >
Cc: Messinger, Craig <Craie.Messinp,er@allentownpa.eov>; Hartzell, Brent <Brent.Hartzell(ôallentownpa.gov>
Subject: RE:2019 Engineering Budget - (46) A (68) Accounts

No, Engineering would need 514,000 of the SL9,000 to remain in the (46) account for the 201.9 plotter lease payments
I mistakenly noted the amount as "PA One Activity Fee" and in Budget Memo #5, that amount is being removed from
the (a6) account.

lf we use the other funds in the (46) account for the first/second lease payment, it would short the other items
budgeted for in 2019

Regards,

Casandra Magliane

1

6L+¿Ø go1/.ra¿4ø Br@e



From: Wagenhurst, Barbara <Barbara.Wasenhur >

Sent: Monday, December 3,2OL8 4:36 PM

To: Magliane, Casandra <Casa ndra.MaFliane @allentown pa.eov>

Cc Messinger, Craig <Craie.Messineer@allentownpa.gov>; Hartzell, Brent <Brent.Hartze¡l@allentownpa.Rov>

Subfec: RE: 2019 Engineering Budget - (46) & (58)Accounts

My apologies, I thought it was just a matter of moving from one account to another. ls there any money to start in 2019

paying OCE?

Flom: Magliane, Casandra

Sent: Monday, December 3,2018 3:46 PM

To: Wagenhurst, Barbara <Barba ra'Wagenhurst@allentownpa.sov>

Gc: Messinger, Craig <Craig.Messinser@-allentownpa.Rov>; Hartzell, Brent <Brent.Hartzell@allentown0a.Êov>

Subtec: RE: 2019 Engineering Budget - (46) & (68) Accounts

Thank you.

So I would transfer from the unencumbered balance at that point?

Regards,

Casandra Magliane

Bþu,lá go1'Lrte{-f ø 6rØ9o..

From: Wagenhurst, Barbara .Bttbtta.Wtu"nhurtt@tll"nao*noa.*out
Sent: Monday, December 3, 2018 3:06 PM

To: Magliane, Casandra <Casandra, Maslia ne @al lentown pa'eov>

Gc: Messinger, Craig <Craie.Messinser@allentownpa.s,ov>; Hartzell, Brent <BrenLHartzell@allentownpa'eov>

Sublect: RE: 2019 Engineering Budget - (46) A (58) Accounts

Sorry, l,m not surprised if some were missed. We can do a tr¿nsfer in January to move the money so that it is paid from

the proper account.

From: Magliane, Casandra

Sent: Monda¡ December 3, 2018 3:00 PM

To: Wagenhurst, Barbara <Barbara.Wasenhurst@allentownpa.sov>

Cc: Messinger, Craig <Craig.Messinser@allentownÞa.sov>; Hartzell, Brent <Brent.Hartzell@allentownrra.Êov>

Sublect: RE: 2019 Engineering Budget - (46) & (68) Accounts

Barb

I was just looking at this evenings agenda and noticed that the change listed in the email thread below did not make ¡t to

the budget memo.

The pA One Call Activity Fee line item for $19,OOO in the Engineering (46) account should be changed to read 'OCE

Plotter lease' @ S1+,OOO. The lease payments wíll not end until September 2019.

Regards,

Casandra Magliane

2



BLu,{d, gaþa'ft($ * 6nfu e ..

From: Wagenhurst, Barbara <Barbara.Waeenhurst@allentownpa.Bov>
Sent: Wednesday, November 28, 2018 3:52 PM
To: Magliane, Casandra <Casandra.Maeliane(ôallentownpa.eov>
Cc Messinge r, Crai¿<Cra ie. M essi n ge r@ a I lentown Ba.ggv>
Subject: RE:2019 Engineering Budget - (46) & (68) Accounts

Thank you.

From: Magliane, Casandra
Sem: Tuesday, November2T,ZOLB 3:49 PM

To: Wagenhurst, Barbara <Barba ra.Wap.enh urst@a I lentown pa.eov>

Cc Messinger, Craig <Craie. Messinger@a llentown Þa.Èov>
Subject: 2019 Engineering Budget - (46) & (68)Accounts

Barb

I am going through the budget to make the tracking sheets for the departments and noticed something

At the council review on t1.l21- - Courtney mentioned that the PA#l act¡v¡ty was in both the (46) account & (68)
accounts.
I said that the one in the (46) account can be removed; but it cannot be removed.

The line item for 519,000 in the (46) account should read "OCE Plotter lease"
o This is the monthly lease payment which ends on 9lt4lL9
o According to Lisa Cocca, we will need around 514,000 for 2019

The line item for 513,000 in the (68) account is the correct amount & distribution for the 'actual' PA#l Act¡v¡ty
Fee

I don't believe this was caught prior, since the proposed amounts lined up. I apologize for the error.

Regards,

Casandra Magliane

Ha+¿,//..¿. dag go* dzørvø

CASANDRA L. MAGLIANE
PUBLIC WORKS OPERATIONS MANAGER

Engineering
M1 S. 1Oth St,,3rd Floor
Allentown, PA 18103
P:61O.437.7587
E: Casandra.Magliane@allentownpa.gov
W: www.allenlownpa.gov

lor the ¡ntended rec¡pients.
cr copy Please

o

a
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disseminate.



b€ inlercepted, c/Dtrupled. lost, d€Sttoyed, arrive late or lncomplele, or conlaln vlrUSeS. I nO Senoel

thêr fore áoes nol aicept liability for any errors or omtssions ¡n the cotrtents of this messege, wtìl6h

å result of e-mail tr€nsm¡ss¡m. lf verilìcâtion is , , requesl á ' version.
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