
BID No. 2017-01- Road Materials BID TABULATION

CITY OF ALLENTOWN

PURCHASING OFFICE

Public Opening: February 27, 2017

At 2:00 pm

NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

1 AASHTO # 1 50 TON Ormrod $11.10 $555.00 No Bid   No Bid    No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $9.75 $487.50

2 1/4" WASHED STONE 200 TON Ormrod $12.75 $2,550.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   

3 3/8" WASHED STONE 300 TON Ormrod $16.75 $5,025.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $13.00 $3,900.00

4 AASHTO #57 50 TON Ormrod $11.35 $567.50 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $10.38 $519.00

5 2A STONE 1,000 TON Egypt $8.25 $8,250.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $7.48 $7,480.00

6 2 RC STONE 150 TON Kutztown $5.35 $802.50 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $6.50 $975.00

7 3A CLEAN STONE 250 TON Kutztown $11.10 $2,775.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $10.48 $2,620.00

8 R4 STONE 60 TON Kutztown $16.70 $1,002.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $13.50 $810.00

9 GABION STONE 100 TON Ormrod $16.70 $1,670.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $13.50 $1,350.00

10 ANTI SKID AS3 SIMILAR to AASHTO #8 500 TON Ormrod $12.75 $6,375.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $13.00 $6,500.00

11 SHOT ROCK 250 TON Ormrod $9.00 $2,250.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $9.00 $2,250.00

12 #10 SCREENING 300 TON Ormrod $13.75 $4,125.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materails $11.00 $3,300.00

13 YELLOW MASON SAND 100 TON No  Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $35.00 $3,500.00

N/A  N/A  N/A N/A  N/A  N/A   N/A

$35,947.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00  $0.00 $0.00 $33,691.50

NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

14
R6 STONE (BEING CONSIDERED IN 

LIEU OF ITEM NO. 10 SHOT ROCK)
250 TON Ormrod $20.15 $5,037.50 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $18.00 $4,500.00

NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

15 PG 64-22 (AC-20) 200 GAL Wescosville $4.90 $980.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   ABE Materials $4.50 $900.00

16 E-3 EMULSION 300 GAL No Bid   $3.75 $1,125.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   

17
ASTM D-6690 Type I RUBBERIZED 

CRACK SEAL
75,000 LBS No Bid    $0.47 $35,250.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   

18 CSS1H 2,500 GAL No Bid   $4.15 $10,375.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   

19 AE_T 2,500 GAL No Bid   $3.15 $7,875.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   ABE Materials $3.00 $7,500.00

20
Asphalt emulsion pavement sealer 

fortified with sand for slip resistance. 
4,000 GAL No Bid   No Bid   No Bid    $2.80 $11,200.00 No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   

 

21 AE_T 2,500 GAL No Bid   $4.25 $10,625.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   

22 CSS1H 2,500 GAL No Bid   $5.25 $13,125.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   

23
E-3 EMULSION (MINIMUM 

500GALLLON PER ORDER)
8,000 GAL No Bid   $4.25 $34,000.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   

24 ASTM D-6690 Type I RUBBERIZED 

CRACK SEAL
75,000 LBS No Bid   $0.47 $35,250.00

P&T 

Products

Dura-Fill 

$0.45 $33,750.00 No Bid   No Bid  No Bid  No Bid   

NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

25
Asphalt emulsion pavement sealer 

fortified with sand for slip resistance. 
2000 GAL No Bid   No Bid   No Bid    $3.00 $6,000.00 No Bid  No Bid   No Bid   

$980.00 $147,625.00 $33,750.00 $17,200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $8,400.00

NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

26

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 9.5MM PG 

64-22 WEARING COURSE 0 TO 0.3 

MILLION ESAL'S (SRL H) 1-1/2" DEPTH

200 TON Wescosville $48.80 $9,760.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   
Coopersburg 

Materials
$46.00 $9,200.00 No Bid   

27

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 9.5 MM PG 

64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 

MILLION ESAL'S (SRL H) 1-1/2" DEPTH

9,000 TON Wescosville & Ormrod$46.20 $415,800.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   
Coopersburg 

Materials
$43.75 $393,750.00 No Bid   

28

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 12.5 MM PG 

64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 

MILLION ESAL'S (SRL H) 1 1/2"-2" 

DEPTH

200 TON Wescosville & Ormrod$46.45 $9,290.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   
Coopersburg 

Materials
$46.00 $9,200.00 No Bid   

29

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 19 MM PG 

64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 

MILLION ESAL'S (SRL H) 2 1/2"-3" 

DEPTH

400 TON Ormrod $41.30 $16,520.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   
Coopersburg 

Materials
$41.55 $16,620.00 No Bid   

30

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 19 MM PG 

64-22 BINDER COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 

MILLION ESAL'S (SRL H) 2 1/2"-3" 

DEPTH

3,000 TON Ormrod $38.85 $116,550.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   
Coopersburg 

Materials
$41.55 $124,650.00 No Bid   

31

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 25MM PG 

64-22 BINDER COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 

MILLION ESAL'S 3"-5" DEPTH

3,000 TON Ormrod $36.55 $109,650.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   
Coopersburg 

Materials
$37.95 $113,850.00 No Bid   

32
SUPERPAVE DESIGN 25MM PG

 64-22 3-30 ESAL'sBCBC 3"-5" DEPTH
7,000 TON Ormrod $35.45 $248,150.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   

Coopersburg 

Materials
$36.95 $258,650.00 No Bid   

CONTRACTOR DELIVERED - ASPHALT CONTRACTOR TO FURNISH AND DELIVER TO ANY POINT IN 

TOTAL GROUP 2

GROUP 3 - PREMIXES

GROUP 1 - CRUSHED AGGREGATES - CITY TO PICK UP AT VENDOR'S PLANT

GROUP 2 - ASPHALT - CITY TO PICK UP

ADD $___/TON FOR VENDOR TO DELIVER AGGREGATES TO ANY LOCATION IN THE CITY
TOTAL GROUP 1

CRUSHED AGGREGATES

New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc.

ATTN:  Jeffrey D. Detwiler

220 Park Rd., P.O. Box 177

Winfield, PA  17889

Phone:  (717) 354-1302   

 Fax:  (570) 524-7995

Email:  jdetwiler@nesl.com

Bid Security:  Bid Bond - 10% of amount Bid

Asphalt Maintenance Solutions, LLC

ATTN:  Terry Crouthamel

P.O. Box 387

Center Valley, PA  18034

Phone: (610) 797-2645 

Fax: (610) 797-4654

Email:  tcrouthamel@amsroads.com

Bid Security:  Bid Bond - 10% of the Bid 

amount

P & T Products, Inc.

ATTN:  Jennifer Findley

472 Industrial Parkway

Sandusky, OH  44870

Phone: (419) 621-1966 

 Fax:  (419) 621-1988

Email:  jennifer@p-tproductsinc.com

Bid Security:  Cashier's Check $3,375.00

Sealmaster

ATTN:  Sean Amey

6853 Ruppsville Rd.

Allentown, PA  18106

Phone:  (610) 530-8788  

Fax:  (610) 530-8792

Email - sealmaster.Sean@verizon.net

Bid Security:  Cashier's Check $1,720.00

Hei-Way LLC

ATTN:  Kean Pitcairn

290 North Pike Rd.

Sarver, PA  16055

Phone:  (724) 353-2700

Fax:  (724) 353-2888

Email - infro@hei-way.com

Bid Security - Bid Bond - 10% of Bid

Coopersburg Materials

Division of Naceville Materials, JV

ATTN:  H. Christian Budenz

483 Springfield St.

Coopersburg, PA  18036

Phone:  (610) 222-3622

Fax:  (610) 584-1529

Email - bschatz@hkgroup.com

Bid Security - Bid Bond - 10% of Bid

ABE Materials, Div of H& K Group

ATTN:  H. Christian Budenz

5137 Lower Mud Run Rd.

Easton, PA  18040

Phone:  (610) 222-3622

Fax:  (610) 584-1529

Email - bschatz@hkgroup.com

Bid Security - Bid Bond - 10% of Bid

GROUP 1 - CRUSHED AGGREGATES - CITY TO PICK UP AT VENDOR'S PLANT



BID No. 2017-01- Road Materials BID TABULATION

CITY OF ALLENTOWN

PURCHASING OFFICE

Public Opening: February 27, 2017

At 2:00 pm

NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

33

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 9.5 MM PG 

64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 

MILLION ESAL'S (SRL M) 1-1/2" DEPTH

2,000 TON Ormrod $43.50 $87,000.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   
Coopersburg 

Materials
$43.75 $87,500.00 No Bid   

34

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 12.5 MM PG 

64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 

MILLION ESAL'S (SRL M) 1 1/2"-2" 

DEPTH

100 TON Ormrod $44.10 $4,410.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   
Coopersburg 

Materials
$41.00 $4,100.00 No Bid   

NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

35

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 19 MM PG 

64-22 WEARING COURSE 0.3 TO 3.0 

MILLION ESAL'S (SRL M) 2 1/2"-3" 

DEPTH

250 TON Ormrod $38.85 $9,712.50 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   
Coopersburg 

Materials
$41.55 $10,387.50 No Bid   

36 ID-2 (Marshall Mix) 300 TON Ormrod $43.50 $13,050.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   

Coopersburg 

Materials- 

BASE

$37.95 $11,385.00 No Bid   

WEARING $43.75 $13,125.00

37

SUPERPAVE DESIGN 4.75MM PG 

64-22 WEARING COURSE .3 TO 3.0 

MILLION ESAL'S (SRL M) 1/2" to 3/4" 

DEPTH

150 TON Wescosville $59.50 $8,925.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  No Bid   
Coopersburg 

Materials
$65.00 $9,750.00 No Bid   

38
QPR 2000 HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD 

PATCH
20 TON No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid  $109.00 $2,180.00

 Co Star 

Quote
  Co Star Quote   

N/A No Bid  N/A No Bid  N/A No Bid N/A No Bid $11.00/ton     N/A  N/A

$1,048,817.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,180.00 $1,062,167.50 $0.00

 

NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION QUARRY UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

39

UPM HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD 

PATCH (BEING CONSIDERED IN LIEU 

OF ITEM NO. 31 QPR 2000)

20 TON Ormrod $116.00 $2,320.00 No Bid   No Bid   No Bid    $109.00 $2,180.00 No Bid   Co Star Quote   

NO. PRODUCTS/SERVICES QTY UNIT VENDOR UNIT PRICE EXTENSION VENDOR UNIT PRICE EXTENSION VENDOR UNIT PRICE EXTENSION VENDOR UNIT PRICE EXTENSION VENDOR UNIT PRICE EXTENSION VENDOR UNIT PRICE EXTENSION VENDOR UNIT PRICE EXTENSION

40
NON-WOVEN OL PAVING GEOTEXTILE 

12' 6" X 360'
70 EA No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   

41

HEAVY WEIGHT GEOTEXTILE FOR 

GROUND STABILIZATION AND 

EROSION CONTROL 12' 

6" X 360)

20 EA No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   No Bid   

42 DELIVERY CHARGE TO CITY FACILITY 1 LT N/A  N/A  N/A  N/A N/A N/A N/A

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00TOTAL GROUP 4

TOTAL GROUP 3

GROUP 3 - PREMIXES - CITY TO PICK UP AT VENDOR'S PLANT

ALTERNATES

GROUP 4 - GEOTEXTILES

ADD $ 11.00/TON FOR VENDOR TO DELIVER AGGREGATES TO ANY LOCATION IN THE CITY


