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CITY OF ALLENTOWN BUDGET TRANSFER REQUEST FORM

TO: Seth O'Neill, Director FROM: Jean Brossman/Lucinda Wright
BUREAU: Department of Finance |BUREAU:
TRANSFER DETAIL
Date of Request: Fund: General Transfer Amount: $26,846.00

FROM (DEBIT)

neo ) TRNSFERAMOWTI) oS CURRENTACGONT  ACCOUNTIOTALA°TER
000-02-0901-0004-46 $26,846.00 337,900.00 $335,400.00 308,554.00
Other Contract Services | | | -

TO (CREDIT)

000-09-0901-0004-72 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $0.00 | 20,000.00
Equipment | _ | -
000-02-0903-0001-72 _ 6,846.00 7,000.00 154.00 7,000.00
Equipment _ -

Reason Transfer is Required:

The 30 foot Christmas tree had to be replaced. This was not realized until the tree was taken down at the end of January 2022. We requested quotes and selected the
lowest bid which was MOSCA. Their discounted price expired on February 28, 2022, therefore we utilized funds from available sources of the correct account with the intent
to replace the spent funds by transfer.

Reason Funds are Available for Transfer:

The utilized funds were just to be borrowed due to the time expiration of the special offer. The funds will be replaced by this transfer. The funding source was entered into
the 2022 budget for contracted events, however tw Q%t viable this year.

TRANSFER AUTHORIZATIONS WITHIN & BETWEEN PROGRAMS
Amount not more than $5,000.00

- ‘Amount is greater than $5,000._09 ) o .
Department Head/Deputy Director: | ( J{!:{i j{ ;:__;f f”’t "K/,f__‘ | Date:. ﬂ/ , S / J-}
Director of Finance/Deputy Director: A o b L0 \\‘\":_\__\,_Q%-«, \\k_f_a - | Date :{\ \\ ]l,__
City Controller (if amount is greater than $5,0E)0 : Bg \j - . Date: S v / _t - ?__-—
Mayor/Managing Director (if amount is greater than $8,880)! ‘ / t/’—\,‘_ | Date: 2- |- e N
Referred to City Council in accordance with the provisions of the Admihisisétive Code, Section 130.04: Date:

/ CITY COUNCIL

Cynthia Mota, President ’ ] Approved 1 Disapproved | Date:
Ed Zucal, Vice President 1 Approved ] Disapproved Date:.

Candida Affa, Councilperson

] Approved ] Disapproved | Date:_

Ce-Ce Gerlach, Councilperson

Daryt Hendricks, Councilperson 1 Approved ] Disapproved Date:_

Natalie Santos, Councilperson 1 Approved ] Disapproved Date:

o - e e - e

[
[
[
1 Approved [ ] Disapproved Date:
{
[
[

Joshua Siegel, Councilperson 1 Approved ] Disapproved Date:_
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Brossman, Jean

To: Holtzman, Rick; Wright, Lucinda; Rhoads, Robert
Cc: Lightner, Leonard; EI-Chaar, Karen; Snyder, Judy; Bianco, Christian; Kistler, Vicky
Subject: RE: Holiday Tree

The account numbers have changed. | have spoken with Leonard this morning regarding funding for the Christmas tree.
000-09-0901-0004-72 - $20,000
000-09-0903-0001-72 - $6,846

We will replace the funds from 000-09-0903-0001-72 by transfer.

This will allow the City to take advantage of the discounted price by February 28,

From: Holtzman, Rick <Rick.Holtzman@allentownpa.gov>

Sent: Friday, February 25, 2022 8:54 AM

To: Wright, Lucinda <Lucinda.Wright@allentownpa.gov>

Cc: Lightner, Leonard <Leonard.Lightner@allentownpa.gov>; El-Chaar, Karen <Karen.El-Chaar@allentownpa.gov>;
Rhoads, Robert <Robert.Rhoads@allentownpa.gov>; Snyder, Judy <Judy.Snyder@allentownpa.gov>; Bianco, Christian

<Christian.Bianco@allentownpa.gov>; Brossman, Jean <Jean.Brossman@allentownpa.gov>
Subject: RE: Holiday Tree

Jean gave us a call this morning. We have account numbers and are working through the process to try and get this

ordered in time to receive the discount. Rob is working on setting up the vendor in our system and then will enter the
Requisition.

We will do our best to get this ordered now that we have account numbers.

AQ%entown

All Inspiring

Rick Holtzman
Deputy Director - Parks

Department of Parks and Rec - Parks Maintenance | City of Allentown
2050 Park Drive

Allentown, PA, 18103
L. +1(610) 437-7626 x2163

ﬁ+1 (610) 797-8451
0 +1(610) 841-6572



£ARick.Holtzman@allentownpa.gov

QE9

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the intended recipients. If you are not an intended recipient you should not diss.eminate,' di_stribute or
copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. E-mail transmission cannot
be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore does

not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as a result of e-mail fransmission. If verification is required please request a hard-
copy version.

From: Wright, Lucinda <Lucinda.Wright@allentownpa.gov>

Sent: Friday, February 25, 2022 8:34 AM

To: Holtzman, Rick <Rick.Holtzman@allentownpa.gov>; Brossman, Jean <Jean.Brossman@alientownpa.gov>

Cc: Bianco, Christian <Christian.Bianco@allentownpa.gov>; Lightner, Leonard <Leonard.Lightner@allentownpa.gov>;

Rhoads, Robert <Robert.Rhoads@allentownpa.gov>; Snyder, Judy <Judy.Snyder@allentownpa.gov>; El-Chaar, Karen
<Karen.El-Chaar@allentownpa.gov>

Subject: RE: Holiday Tree

My understanding was that once the quotes were received, and we were advised the cost of the lowest, CED would
provide an account number.

I just spoke with Jean and she is going to be making confirmations on cost and account.

AQ%entown

Al Inspiring

Lucinda Wright

Special Events Manager

Community and Economic Development | City of Allentown
435 Hamilton Street

Allentown, PA, 18101

R, +1(610) 437-7610 x2181

[} +1 (484) 426-8396

K3Lucinda.Wright@allentownpa.gov

Q&9

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the intended recipients. If you are not an intended recipient you should not disseminate, distribute or
copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. E-mail transmission cannot
be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore does

not accept lizbility for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as a result of e-mail transmission. If verification is required please request a hard-
copy version.

From: Holtzman, Rick <Rick.Holtzman@allentownpa.gov>
Sent: Friday, February 25, 2022 8:01 AM

To: Brossman, Jean <Jean.Brossman@allentownpa.gov>; Wright, Lucinda <Lucinda.Wright@allentownpa.gov>
Cc: Bianco, Christian <Christian.Bianco@allentownpa.gov>; Lightner, Leonard <Leonard.Lightner@allentownpa.gov>;

Rhoads, Robert <Robert.Rhoads@allentownpa.gov>; Snyder, Judy <Judy.Snyder@allentownpa.gov>; El-Chaar, Karen
<Karen.El-Chaar@allentownpa.gov>

Subject: RE: Holiday Tree

Today is Friday February 25%. At this point we do not have an account number to purchase the tree. To receive the

discount from the low bidder the tree must be purchased by Feb 28. If we do not purchase the tree by Feb. 28" the
price of the tree will increase by $11k.

The purchase of the Tree was tasked to me on Tuesday Feb. 15. We have taken this as far as we can at this point. Please
let me know how you would like to proceed?



AQQentown

All Inspiring

Rick Holtzman

Deputy Director - Parks

Department of Parks and Rec - Parks Maintenance | City of Allentown

2050 Park Drive

Allentown, PA, 18103

. +1(610) 437-7626 x2163

B +1 (610) 797-8451

[J +1 (610) 841-6572

£&IRick.Holtzman@allentownpa.gov
This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the intended recipients. If you are not an intended recipient you should not disseminate, distribute or
cony this e-mail. Please noti'y the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from vour system. E-mail transmission cannot

be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore does

not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message. which arise as a result of e-mail transmission. If verification is required please request a hard-
copy version.

From: Holtzman, Rick

Sent: Wednesday, February 23, 2022 12:39 PM

To: Brossman, Jean <Jean.Brossman@allentownpa.gov>; Wright, Lucinda <Lucinda.Wright@allentownpa.gov>

Cc: Bianco, Christian <Christian.Bianco @allentownpa.gov>; Lightner, Leonard <Leonard.Lightner@allentownpa.gov>;

Rhoads, Robert <Robert.Rhoads@allentownpa.gov>; Snyder, Judy <Judy.Snyder@allentownpa.gov>
Subject: RE: Holiday Tree

At this point | believe Rob has the quotes he needs to enter the requisition. Can someone please provide us with an
account number so we can get the new tree in the queue?

I also wanted to ask about our old tree and Rileighs. Our old tree is stored with Rileighs at this time per our current
contract. When does this contract expire because we will need to make plans to pick up our tree? My hope would be

that the contract does not expire until October or November so they would store the tree until we are ready to pick it up
and set up for Lights in the Parkway.

We will need to find storage for both of these trees at the end of the holiday season. | am asking for help to talk to other
City Departments to look at their areas to identify possible space for 1 or 2 trees to be stored. | do not know exactly how
much space we will need at this point but | do know that the limbs of the trees cannot be stacked.

From: Brossman, Jean <Jean.Brossman@allentownpa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, February 22, 2022 8:53 AM

To: Snyder, Judy <Judy.Snyder@allentownpa.gov>; Rhoads, Robert <Robert.Rhoads@allentownpa.gov>

Cc: Wright, Lucinda <Lucinda.Wright@allentownpa.gov>; Bianco, Christian <Christian.Bianco@allentownpa.gov>;

Holtzman, Rick <Rick.Holtzman@allentownpa.gov>; Lightner, Leonard <Leonard.Lightner@allentownpa.gov>
Subject: RE: Holiday Tree

I have not received their quote.



AQ%entown

Al Inspiring

Jean Brossman

Executive Secretary

Community and Economic Development | City of Allentown
435 Hamilton Street

Allentown, PA, 18101

. +1 (610) 437-7610 x2712

£4Jean.Brossman@allentownpa.gov

QE9

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the intended recipients. If you are not an intended recipient you should not disseminate, distribute or
copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. E-mail transmission cannot
be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore dees

not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as a result of e-mait transmission. If verification is required please request a hard-
copy version.

From: Snyder, Judy <Judy.Snyder@allentownpa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, February 22, 2022 8:22 AM

To: Rhoads, Robert <Robert.Rhoads@allentownpa.gov>; Brossman, Jean <Jean.Brossman@allentownpa.gov>
Cc: Wright, Lucinda <Lucinda.Wright@allentownpa.gov>; Bianco, Christian <Christian.Bianco@allentownpa.gov>;

Holtzman, Rick <Rick.Holtzman@allentownpa.gov>; Lightner, Leonard <Leonard.Lightner@allentownpa.gov>
Subject: RE: Holiday Tree

Also | sent out an email to PA Landscape they did not send me anything either

AQ%entown

All Inspiring

Judy Snyder

Buyer

Purchasing Department | City of Allentown
435 Hamilton Street

Allentown, PA, 18101

S, +1 (610) 437-7624 x2228

1B +1 (610) 437-7618
£2Judy.Snyder@allentownpa.gov

QE0

This message lcontains confidential information and is intended only for the intended recipients. If you are not an intended recipient you should not disseminate, distribute or
copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. E-mail transmission cannot
be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore does

not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as a resull of e-mail transmission. If verification is required please request a hard-
COpy version.

From: Rhoads, Robert <Robert.Rhoads@allentownpa.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, February 22, 2022 8:14 AM
To: Brossman, Jean <Jean.Brossman@allentownpa.gov>

Cc: Wright, Lucinda <Lucinda.Wright@allentownpa.gov>; Bianco, Christian <Christian.Bianco@allentownpa.gov>;
Holtzman, Rick <Rick.Holtzman@allentownpa.gov>; Lightner, Leonard <Leonard.Lightner@allentownpa.gov>; Snyder,
Judy <Judy.Snyder@allentownpa.gov>
Subject: RE: Holiday Tree

Hello All,



I never did receive a quote from PA Landscape. Also, | need the account we’re using for this purchase.

Thanks,
Rob

AQ%entown

All tnspiring

Robert E. Rhoads III

Administrative Supervisor

Department of Parks and Recreation | City of Allentown
2050 Park Dr

Allentown, PA, 18104

L, +1(610) 437-7626 x2164

B £ARobert.Rhoads@allentownpa.gov

Qe

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the intended recipients. If you are not an intended recipient you should not disseminate, distribute or
copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. E-mail transmission cannot
be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore does

not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as a result of e-mail transmission. If verification is required please request a hard-
copy version.

From: Brossman, Jean <Jean.Brossman@allentownpa.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, February 15, 2022 1:03 PM

To: Rhoads, Robert <Robert.Rhoads@allentownpa.gov>

Cc: Wright, Lucinda <Lucinda.Wright@allentownpa.gov>; Bianco, Christian <Christian.Bianco@allentownpa.gov>;

Holtzman, Rick <Rick.Holtzman@allentownpa.gov>; Lightner, Leonard <Leonard.Lightner@allentownpa.gov>; Snyder,
Judy <Judy.Snyder@allentownpa.gov>
Subject: Holiday Tree

Per Judy Snyder...
We will need three quotes for the requisition for a Christmas tree. Attached are two quotes (Mosca and

Rileighs). Pennsylvania Landscape will be email a quote directly to you in the next day or so. Once you receive the third

quote, would you please enter the requisition? Leonard and/or Lucinda will provide you with the account number for
the requisition.

Rob, thank you for you assistance.

AQ%entown

All Inspiring

Jean Brossman
Executive Secretary

Community and Economic Development | City of Allentown
435 Hamilton Street
Allentown, PA, 18101

L, +1(610) 437-7610 x2712
KAJean.Brossman@allentownpa.gov



QEe

This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the intended recipients. If you are not an intended recipient you should not disseminate, distribute or
copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. E-mail transmission cannot
be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, arrive late or incomplete, or contain viruses. The sender therefore does
not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this message, which arise as a result of e-mail transmission. If verification is required please request a hard-

copy version.



